
Title: Voice of the Martyrs and Immanuel Approach in Pakistan 
 
March 27, 2010, 
 
Greetings all, 
 
I have been working on a section for our upcoming book that includes a brief summary of 
testimonies regarding the work the Lord is doing through the Immanuel approach, and I 
thought it would be encouraging to send these pieces out to you. Pieces of some of these 
stories have gone out in earlier e-mails, but these are the most updated and complete 
accounts. First installment is a story about Voice of the Martyrs and Immanuel Approach in 
Asia. 
 
Blessings, 
 
Dr. Lehman/Karl 
 
Want to support the Lehman’s Immanuel Approach work?  Click here for more information: 
https://www.immanuelapproach.com/supporting-lehmans-immanuel-approach-work/ 
 
 
Voice of the Martyrs and Immanuel Approach in Pakistan: 
 
Our colleagues who are using the Immanuel approach are also seeing dramatically positive 
results. Kim Campbell, the medical director for Voice of the Martyrs, has been using the 
Immanuel approach to provide emotional healing for traumatized/persecuted Christians in 
countries such as Pakistan, Nepal, Sri Lanka, Nigeria, the Philippines, Ethiopia, Iraq, Laos, 
Thailand, Myanmar, and Columbia. The following is one of the many amazing stories of healing 
that Kim has shared with us.   
 
David was born into a deeply religious Muslim family in a Muslim village in Pakistan, and his 
Muslim family members and neighbors became very upset when he and one of his uncles 
became Christians. Not surprisingly, local Muslims became even more upset when his uncle 
began openly telling others about his faith, when David began preaching, and when people 
were delivered and miraculously healed in response to David=s prayers.  David was twenty six 
years old in July of 2006 when his uncle was abducted and executed by a group of enraged 
villagers,  and a month and a half later two men with AK-47s came into the family sweet shop 
where David worked and emptied 50 rounds, leaving David lying in a pool of blood with 11 
gunshot wounds.  His survival is miraculous, since the doctor at the local hospital refused to 
treat him, and he therefore did not receive any medical care until he got to a hospital in a 
distant city eight hours later, but his left arm was so badly damaged that it had to be 
amputated. 
 
Voice of the Martyrs helped David with the cost of his medications and with a prosthesis for his 

https://www.immanuelapproach.com/supporting-lehmans-immanuel-approach-work/


left arm, and when Kim visited in October of 2007 to provide medical follow-up he also asked 
David about the psychological aspect of the trauma.  David stated that he was Aall right,@ but 
his face and voice looked and sounded depressed, and with further probing Kim discovered that 
he had full blown Post Traumatic Stress Disorder (PTSD), including flashbacks of the machine 
gun fire during the attack.  Kim then lead him through the Immanuel process, and the Lord 
showed David that He had always been with him, that He was with him throughout every 
moment of the attack, and that He would always be with him in the future.  At the end of the 
ministry time, when Kim asked him to go back to the memory of being shot, David sat quietly, 
with a surprised but peaceful look on his face, as he reported that he could still recall being 
startled by the shooting but that he was now aware of Jesus= presence with him, in the memory, 
even during the shooting, and that the memory was no longer distressing.  (David’s name has 
been changed to protect his safety.) 


